
3 sovrum Villa till salu i Albox, Almería

Exclusively presented by Almeria Homes! This stunning detached villa in the Albox area offers three spacious
bedrooms and two bathrooms, set within a generous plot of 2,823 m². The property, in excellent condition, combines
modern living with breathtaking far-reaching views, perfect for those seeking a serene lifestyle in Spain.

Situated in a highly sought-after location, this villa is only a 7-8 minute walk from the large market town of Albox,
which provides all necessary amenities for day-to-day living. By car, it's a mere 1-minute drive (550 metres), or a 2-
minute cycle, making it incredibly convenient.

The highlight of the property is undoubtedly the private, recently refurbished 8x4m swimming pool. This stunning pool
features a built-in seating area, colour-changing lights, and a stainless steel handrail, offering a luxurious swimming
experience. Surrounding the pool is a spacious tiled terrace, ideal for sunbathing and relaxation. The pool area is
south-facing, ensuring plenty of sunshine and high levels of privacy, and provides impressive views of the surrounding
landscape.

Adjacent to the pool, a large covered terrace with a handmade wooden pergola offers ample space for seating, dining,
and entertaining. This area includes a BBQ section, with Moroccan-style tiles providing shade, wind protection, and
privacy. The covered terrace is equipped with lighting and a ceiling fan, making it a comfortable spot to enjoy the
stunning views at any time of day.

The beautifully landscaped garden beyond the pool area features winding pathways, rockeries, and various shaded
seating areas under large wooden pergolas. Planted with mature trees, fruit trees, native plants, and flowering shrubs,
the garden is a tranquil haven. A brick-built storage room and a wooden storage room provide ample space for
gardening tools and equipment.

On the side of the villa, another shaded seating area with a partly covered wooden pergola offers additional outdoor
space, adorned with Moroccan tiles and natural stone for a touch of elegance. 

The driveway, laid to gravel, accommodates several cars and even a motorhome if required. The majority of the plot is
fenced and gated, ensuring security and privacy, with the remaining land extending beyond the fence on either side. 

Inside, the villa features a spacious and bright open-plan living-dining room, complete with hot and cold air
conditioning, a modern remote control ceiling fan, and a high-quality pellet burner. The recently installed kitchen
boasts high-quality modern units, large drawers, an integrated oven and microwave, a washing machine, a modern
extractor, a 5-ring gas hob, Silestone worktops, and a door leading to the covered area on the side of the villa.

  Se videotur   3 sovrum   2 badrum
  120m² Bygg storlek   2.823m² Tomtstorlek   Simbassäng

250.000€

 Fastighet som marknadsförs av Almeria Homes
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