
2 soveværelse Lejlighed til salg i Las Lagunas de Mijas, Málaga

Prices from 405,000 Euros as at 27/08/2025In Planning - Estimated Q4 2027Transcendence. Timelessness.
Distinction.This development is an immersion into the sophistication of the Costa del Sol that transcends standards, a
space where elegance is redefined towards subtlety and quality. Chosen as an exclusive location to enjoy a top-tier
residential experience, Lakün combines cutting-edge architecture with meticulous attention to detail, offering a haven
of comfort at the foot of the Mediterranean.The developments rises with impeccable architecture in a serene and
captivating setting. Its sophisticated charm is revealed in its distinctive terraces, which become wings extended toward
the horizon, combined with elegant windows that bathe each room in the warm light of the Mediterranean sun.The
space and interior design of these residences are a true work of art, where every detail has been meticulously selected
to create an atmosphere of elegance, light, and comfort. From the highest quality materials to the impeccable finishes,
each space reflects a perfect balance between functionality and aesthetics. The harmony in the design is perceivedin
every corner, offering a living experience that is both sophisticated and welcoming.The spacious terraces offer a
private oasis to enjoy with family and friends, where the horizon becomes a daily work of art. Here, you can relax in an
environment that combines natural beauty with the elegance of cutting-edge architecture. With wide space to create
your own outdoor paradise, each terrace is an invitation to enjoy unforgettable moments, from peaceful sunrisesto
evenings under the stars. Each terrace is transformed into a personal and versatile setting, where luxury and comfort
meet to create unforgettable moments. Designed for outdoor living, the terraces offer ample spaces where you can
relax in a private solarium, cool off in an exclusive pool or enjoy a social area with barbecue, ideal for sharing with
friends and family. In every detail, the terraces of Lakün allow the outdoors to be an extension of your home, adapting
to your lifestyle and creating the perfect environment for every occasion.It offers a range of leisure and comfort
opportunities where relaxation intertwines with pleasure. These carefully designed amenities provide a hotel resort
experience from the comfort of home. Entering the experience means immersing yourself in the serenity of a spa,
enjoying refreshing moments in its three pools, finding inspiration in its coworking and meeting area, training and
unwinding in the fitness zone, and enjoying with family and friends in the event space.It offers a co-working space,
video conferencing, and meeting areas with all the amenities and services needed to carry out your professional
activities. Equipped with high-speed internet access, conference rooms, and meeting areas, the co-working zone
becomes a space where, in addition to working, you can network and create professional synergies in a modern and
dynamic environment.It is strategically located between the coastal towns of Fuengirola and Mijas. Fuengirola boasts a
privileged environment due to its beauty and mild climate throughout the year. Its sea stretches along the coast with 8
kilometers of beaches that have been awarded the Blue Flag distinction, a recognition of the quality of its waters and
its soft golden sand. The city also offers experiences to get lost in its streets, a vibrant social life, numerous sunsets,
and a wide variety of nightlife. Mijas, with its picturesque cobbled streets and rich cultural heritage, complements the
urban richness of Fuengirola and its diverse gastronomic offerings, which captivate both locals and visitors.01
bedUrban LivingResidences up to 59 m²Terraces up to 32 m²1,5bedFlex LivingResidences up to 83 m2Terraces up to
60 m202 bedElite SpaceResidences up to 126 m2Terraces up to 97 m203 bedGrand SpaceResidences up to 145
m2Terraces up to 100 m203 bedGrand PenthouseResidences up to 187 m2Terraces up to 203 m23,5 bedFlex Grand

  2 soveværelser   2 badeværelser   92m² Byg størrelse
  28m² Grundstørrelse   Svømmepøl

405.000€
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