
7 soveværelse Villa til salg i Benahavis, Málaga

A luxurious villa for sale in the highly sought-after Monte Halcones urbanisation Designed by a renowned architect
and developed by a reputable promoter, this 2025 property brings modern living to one of the best areas in Benahavis
South-facing, the villa enjoys unobstructed panoramic sea and mountain views, captured through large floor-to-ceiling
windows that bring the beauty of the outdoors inside Spread generously across three floors, the villa encompasses
803 sqm of interior space and an additional 196 sqm of terraces, offering ample outdoor living areas to enjoy the
Mediterranean climate The property features seven bedrooms, each with its own en-suite bathroom, providing privacy
and convenience to all its residents The ground floor features a sleek, high-end kitchen, a formal dining area, and a
stunning living room that leads directly to the outdoor terraces, gardens, and an impressive swimming pool This level
also contains two en-suite bedrooms and a guest apartment, providing versatile livingoptions The villa's thoughtful
layout continues in the basement with a fully equipped gym, a spa, a cinema and games room, plus a wine bodega—
perfect for entertainment and relaxation Furthermore, a handy laundry room and an additional bedroom complete
this level The first floor is reserved for personal retreats featuring the master suite and two more spacious bedrooms,
each enjoying magnificent views and meticulous appointments As you step outside, the villa excels with its extensive
terraces that offer both open-sky and covered areas, making it ideal for any season The outdoor spaces are designed
to celebrate the splendid views while providing ultimate privacy and comfort Whether hosting a grand event or
enjoying a quiet afternoon by the pool, the surroundings are simply perfect Security is paramount, with features like
double glazing and a comprehensive alarm system ensuring peace of mind The property also includes a covered
garage for three cars with an ingenious entry suitable for low-suspension vehicles, alongside additional uncovered
parking spacesThis villa's architect has skillfully created a space that is both modern and functional, ensuring every
detail from room layout to material selection showcases quality and aesthetics Thedeveloper has built a reputation for
properties that excel in both design and construction, promising a home built to the highest standards

  7 soveværelser   7 badeværelser   803m² Byg størrelse
  2.042m² Grundstørrelse

9.600.000€
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